
Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 1 
 

3-15-22 
 
 

ORDINANCE NO.    
 
 

An ordinance adding Chapter 62, “Dallas Swimming Pool and Spa Code,” to the Dallas City Code, 

as amended; adopting with certain changes the 2021 Edition of the International Swimming Pool 

and Spa Code of the International Code Council, Inc.; regulating and governing the construction, 

alteration, movement, renovation, replacement, repair, and maintenance of aquatic facilities, pools, 

and spas; providing a penalty not to exceed $2,000; providing a saving clause; providing a 

severability clause; and providing an effective date. 

 WHEREAS, the 87th Texas Legislature met in regular session between January 12, 2021 and May 

31, 2021; and 

 WHEREAS, H.B. 2205 was filed on February 24, 2021; and 

 WHEREAS, H.B. 2205 adopted the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code as it existed on 

May 1, 2019 as the municipal swimming pool and spa code in the State of Texas; and 

 WHEREAS, H.B.2205 allows a municipality to adopt a more recent version of the International 

Swimming Pool and Spa Code; and  

 WHEREAS, H.B. 2205 was approved by both chambers of the Texas Legislature; and 

  WHEREAS, H.B. 2205 was filed without the governor’s signature on June 18, 2021 and took 

effect on September 1, 2021; Now, Therefore, 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DALLAS: 

SECTION 1. That Chapter 62, “Dallas Swimming Pool and Spa Code,” of the Dallas City 

Code, as amended, is created by adopting the 2021 Edition of the International Swimming Pool 

and Spa Code of the International Code Council, Inc. (which is attached as Exhibit A and made a 

part of this ordinance), with the following amendments: 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 2 
 

1. Subsection [A]101.1, “Title,” of Section 101, “General,” of Part 1, “Scope and 

Application,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2021 International Swimming Pool 

and Spa Code is amended to read as follows: 

“[A] 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Dallas Swimming Pool and Spa Code 
[of [NAME OF JURISDICTION]], hereinafter referred to as “this code.” Except as otherwise 
specified in this chapter, all provisions of Chapter 52, ‘Administrative Procedures for the 
Construction Codes,’ of the Dallas City Code apply to this code. 

 

101.1.1 General. The provisions of this code and the provisions of Chapter 43A, “Swimming 
Pools,” of the Dallas City Code shall control the design and construction of swimming pools, 
spas and hot tubs. To the extent of any conflict between Chapter 62, “Dallas Swimming Pool 
and Spa Code,” of the Dallas City Code, hereafter referred to as “this code”; and other city 
ordinances, this code shall prevail. 
 
101.1.2 Location of pool adjacent to structural footings. The provisions of Section 1808.7 
of Chapter 53, “Dallas Building Code,” of the Dallas City Code, and Section R403.1.7 of 
Chapter 57, “Dallas One- and Two-Family Dwelling Code,” of the Dallas City Code, shall 
control the location of pools adjacent to buildings and other structural footings.” 

 

2. Subsection [A]102.5, ”Historic Buildings,” of Section 102, “Applicability,” of 

Part 1, “Scope and Application,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2021 

International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is amended to read as follows: 

“[A] 102.5 Historic buildings. The provisions of this code relating to the construction, 
alteration, repair, enlargement, restoration, relocation or moving of pools, spas, or systems shall 
not be mandatory for existing pools, spas or systems identified and classified by federal, [the] 
state or local jurisdictions as part of a historic structure where such pools, spas or systems  are 
judged by the code official to be safe and in the public interest of health, safety and welfare 
regarding any proposed construction, alteration, repair, enlargement, restoration, relocation or 
moving of such pool or spa.” 

 
3. Subsection [A]102.9, “Other Laws,” of Section 102, “Applicability,” of Part 1, 

“Scope and Application,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2021 International 

Swimming Pool and Spa Code is amended to read as follows: 

[A]102.9 Other laws. The provisions of this code shall not be deemed to nullify any provisions of 
local, state or federal law, including, but not limited to: 
 
 

 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 3 
 

1. Texas Department of State Health Services (TDSHS); Standards for Public Pools and 
Spas; §285.181 through §285.208, (TDSHS rules do not apply to pools serving one- and 
two-family dwellings or townhomes). 

 
2. Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation (TDLR); Texas Accessibility Standards 

(TAS), provides the scoping and technical requirements for accessibility for swimming 
pools, wading pools and spas and shall comply with the current edition of TAS, Section 
242. (TAS rules do not apply to pools serving one- and two-family dwellings or 
townhomes). 

 
Exception: Elements regulated under Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation 
(TDLR) and built in accordance with TDLR approved plans, including any variances or 
waivers granted by the TDLR, shall be deemed to be in compliance with the requirements 
of this chapter.” 

 

4. Part 2, “Administration and Enforcement,” of   Chapter   1,   “Scope   and 
 

Administration,” of the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is deleted. 
 

5. Subsection 201.3, “Terms Defined in Other Codes,” of Section 201, “General,” of 
 

Chapter 2, “Definitions,” of the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is amended to 

read as follows: 

“201.3 Terms defined in other codes. Where terms are not defined in this code and are defined 
in the Dallas [International] Building Code, Dallas [International] Energy Conservation Code, 
Dallas [International] Fire Code, Dallas [International] Fuel Gas Code, Dallas [International] 
Mechanical Code, Dallas [International] Plumbing Code, Dallas Electrical Code, Dallas Existing 
Building Code, Dallas Green Construction Code, [or] Dallas One-and Two-Family Dwelling 
[International Residential] Code, or the Administrative Procedures for the Construction Codes, 
such terms shall have the meanings ascribed to them as in those codes.” 

 
6. Section 202, “Definitions,” of Chapter 2, “Definitions,” of the 2021 International 

 

Swimming Pool and Spa Code is amended by amending or adding the following defined terms in 

alphabetical order to read as follows: 

“DALLAS HEALTH DEPARTMENT. Regulates the operation of public pools. Routine 
inspections on pools and spas open to the public are conducted to document compliance with the 
standards set forth in state law. 

 

FRENCH DOORS. Double doors, sometimes called double-hinged patio doors, that provide 
access from a dwelling interior to the exterior in which each of the two doors are hinged and 
closable so that the edge of one door closes immediately adjacent to the edge of the other door 
with no partition between the doors. A French door is either one of the two doors. 

 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 4 
 

KEYED DEAD BOLT. A door lock that is not in the doorknob, that locks by a bolt in the 
doorjamb, that has a bolt with at least a 1-inch throw if installed after September 1, 1993, and that 
is operated from the exterior by a key, card or combination and operated from the interior by a 
knob or lever without a key, card or combination. The term includes a doorknob lock that contains 
a bolt with at least a 1-inch throw. 

 

KEYLESS DEAD BOLT. A door lock not in the doorknob that locks: 
 

1. with a bolt with a 1 inch throw into a strike plate screwed into the portion of the doorjamb 
surface that faces the edge of the door when the door is closed or into a metal doorjamb 
that serves as the strike plate, operable only by knob or lever from the door’s interior and 
not in any manner from the door’s exterior, and that is commonly known as a keyless dead 
bolt; 

 
2. by a drop bolt system operated by placing a central metal plate over a metal doorjamb restraint 

which protrudes from the doorjamb and which is affixed to the doorjamb frame by means of 
three case-hardened screws at least 3 inches in length. One half of the central plate must 
overlap the interior surface of the door and the other half of the central plate must overlap the 
doorjamb when the plate is placed over the doorjamb restraint. The drop bolt system must 
prevent the door from being opened unless the central plate is lifted off the doorjamb restraint 
by a person who is on the interior side of the door; or 

 
3. by a metal bar or metal tube that is placed across the entire interior side of the door and 

secured in place at each end of the bar or tube by heavy-duty metal screw hooks. The screw 
hooks must be at least 3 inches in length and must be screwed into the door frame stud or 
wall stud on each side of the door. The bar or tube must be capable of being secured  to both 
of the screw hooks and must be permanently attached in some way to the door frame stud 
or wall stud. When secured to the screw hooks, the bar or tube must prevent the door from 
being opened unless the bar or tube is removed by a person who is on the interior side of 
the door. The term does not include a chain latch, flip latch, surface-mounted slide bolt, 
mortise door bolt, surface-mounted barrel bolt, surface-mounted swing bar door guard, 
spring-loaded night latch, foot bolt or other lock or latch. 

 
PUBLIC SWIMMING POOL (Public Pool). Any man made permanently installed or non- 
portable structure, basin, chamber or tank containing an artificial body of water that is used for 
swimming, diving, aquatic sports or other aquatic activity, [A pool] other than a residential pool, 
that is intended to be used for swimming or bathing and is operated by an owner, lessee, operator, 
licensee or concessionaire, regardless of whether a fee is charged for use. The pool may be publicly 
or privately owned. Public pools shall be further classified and defined as follows: 

 

Class A competition pool. A pool intended for use for accredited competitive aquatic events 
such as Federation Internationale De Natation (FINA), USA Swimming, USA Diving, USA 
Synchronized Swimming, USA Water Polo, National Collegiate Athletic Association 
(NCAA), or the National Federation of State High School Associations (NFHS). A class A 
pool may also be used for recreation. 

 
 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 5 
 

Class B public pool. A pool intended for public recreational use that is not identified in the 
other classifications of public pools. 

 
Class C semi-public pool. Any [A] pool operated [solely] for and in conjunction with: 

 

1. lodgings such as hotels, motels, apartments, [or] condominiums, or mobile home 
parks;[.] 

 

2. property owners associations, private organizations or clubs; or 
 

3. a school, college, or university while being operated for academic or continuing 
education classes. 

 

The use of such a pool would be open to occupants, members or students and their guests, 
but not open to the general public. The term does not include a spa or a decorative fountain 
that is not used as a pool or pools with depths of 18 inches or less. 

 

Class D pool. A wading pool with a maximum water depth of 24 inches at any point. 
 

Class D-1 wave action pool. A pool designed to simulate breaking or cyclic waves for 
purposes of general play or surfing. 
 

Class D-2 activity pool. A pool designed for casual water play ranging from simple splashing 
activity to the use of attractions placed in the pool for recreation. 

 
Class D-3 catch pool. A body of water located at the termination of a manufactured waterslide 
attraction. The body of water is provided for the purpose of terminating the slide action and 
providing a means for exit to a deck or walkway area. 
 
Class D-4 leisure river. A manufactured stream of water of near-constant depth in which the 
water is moved by pumps or other means of propulsion to provide a river-like flow that 
transports bathers over a defined path that may include water features and play devices. 

 
Class D-5 vortex pool. A circular pool equipped with a method of transporting water in the 
pool for the purpose of propelling riders at speeds dictated by the velocity of the moving stream 
of water. 

 
Class D-6 interactive play attraction. A manufactured water play device or a combination of 
water-based play devices in which water flow volumes, pressures or patterns can be varied        by 
the bather without negatively influencing the hydraulic conditions for other connected devices. 
These attractions incorporate devices or activities such as slides, climbing and crawling 
structures, visual effects, user-actuated mechanical devices and other elements of bather-driven 
and bather-controlled play. 

 
Class E. Pools used for instruction, play or therapy and with temperatures above 86°F 
(30°C). 

 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 6 
 

Class F. Class F pools are wading pools and are covered within the scope of this code as set 
forth in Section 405. 

 
Public pools are either a diving or nondiving type. Diving types of public pools are classified 

into types as an indication of the suitability of a pool for use with diving equipment. 
 
Type O. A nondiving public pool. 

 
Types VI–IX. Public pools suitable for the installation of diving equipment by type. 

 
POOL YARD OR SPA YARD. An area that has a pool or spa yard enclosure and that contains 
a pool or spa. 

 

POOL YARD OR SPA YARD ENCLOSURE. A fence, wall or combination of fences, walls, 
gates, windows or doors that completely surround a pool or spa. 

 

POOLS, STATE LAW. Refers to 25 Texas Administrative Code, Chapter 265, Subchapter L, 
“Standards for Swimming Pools and Spas,” which went into effect on September 1, 2004 (except 
Section 265.190, “Suction Outlets and Return Inlets at Post-10/01/99 and Pre-10/01/99 Pools and 
Spas,” which had an effective date of January 1, 2005). 

 

PREMISES. A lot or unplatted tract of land that is reflected in the plat books of the building    
inspection division of the city or other source approved by the building official. Refer to Section 
51-4.601 or Section 51A-4.601 of the Dallas Development Code. 

 

RESIDENTIAL. For purposes of this code, residential applies to detached one- and two-family 
dwellings and townhomes [townhouses] not more than three stories in height. 

 

RESIDENTIAL SWIMMING POOL (Residential Pool). A pool that is located on private 
property under the control of the property owner or the owner’s tenant and that is intended for use 
by not more than two resident families or their guests. It includes a pool serving only a single-family 
home or a duplex [intended for use that is accessory to a residential setting and available only to 
the household and its guests]. Other pools shall be considered to be public pools for purposes of this 
code. 

 
Type O. A nondiving residential pool. 
 
Types I–V. Residential pools suitable for the installation of diving equipment by type. 

 
SPA. A product intended for the immersion of persons in temperature-controlled water circulated 
in a closed system, and not intended to be drained and refilled after [filled with] each use. A spa 
usually includes a filter, an electric, solar or gas heater, a pump or pumps, and a control, and can 
include other equipment, such as lights, blowers, and water-sanitizing equipment. A spa is 
constructed as a permanent or portable structure that is 2 feet or more in depth and that has a 
surface area of 250 square feet or less or a volume of 3,250 gallons or less and that is intended to 
be used for bathing or other recreational uses. It may include, but is not limited to, hydro jet 
circulation, hot water, cold water, mineral baths, air induction bubbles or any combination thereof. 
A spa as referred to in this code is not a business establishment such as a day spa or health spa. 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 7 
 

Industry terminology for a spa includes, but is not limited to, “hydrotherapy pool,” “whirlpool,” 
“hot spa,” hot tub,” etc. 

 
Nonself-contained spa. A factory-built spa in which the water heating and circulating 
equipment is not an integral part of the product. Nonself-contained spas may employ separate 
components such as an individual filter, pump, heater and controls, or they can employ 
assembled combinations of various components. 
 
Permanent residential spa. A spa, that is located on private property under the control of the 
property owner or the owner’s tenant and that is intended for use by not more than two resident 
families or their guests [intended for use that is accessory to a residential setting and available 
to the household and its guests] and where the water heating and water-circulating equipment 
is not an integral part of the product. The spa is intended as a permanent plumbing fixture and 
not intended to be moved. It includes a spa serving only a single-family home or a duplex. 

 

Portable residential spa. A spa that is located on private property under the control of the 
property owner or the owner’s tenant and that is intended for use by not more than two resident 
families or their guests [intended for use that is accessory to a residential setting and available 
to the household and its guests] and where it is either self- contained or nonself-contained. It 
includes a spa serving only a single-family home or a duplex. 

 

Public spa. A spa other than a permanent residential spa or portable residential spa that is 
intended to be used for bathing and is operated by an owner, licensee or concessionaire, 
regardless of whether a fee is charged for use. 

 
Self-contained spa. A factory-built spa in which all control, water heating and water- 
circulating equipment is an integral part of the product. Self-contained spas may be 
permanently wired or cord connected.” 

 
7. Subsection 305.1, “General,” of Section 305, “Barrier Requirements,” of Chapter 3, 

“General Compliance,” of the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is amended to read 

as follows: 

“305.1 General. The provisions of this section shall apply to the design of barriers for restricting 
entry into areas having pools and spas. In one- and two-family dwellings and townhomes, 
w[W]here spas or hot tubs are equipped with a lockable safety cover complying with ASTM F1346 
and swimming pools are equipped with a powered safety cover that complies with ASTM F1346, 
the areas where those spas, hot tubs or pools are located shall not be required to comply with 
Sections 305.2 through 305.7.” 

 
8. Subsection 305.2, “Outdoor Swimming Pools and Spas,” of Section 305, “Barrier 

Requirements,” of Chapter 3, “General Compliance,” of the 2021 International Swimming Pool 

and Spa Code is amended to read as follows: 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 8 
 

“305.2 [Outdoor] S[s]wimming pools and spas. Outdoor pools and spas and indoor swimming 
pools shall be surrounded by a barrier that complies with Sections 305.2.1 through 305.9 and in 
accordance with the Texas Administrative Code and Chapter 757 of the Texas Health and Safety 
Code for public pools [305.7]. 

 

305.2.1 Barrier height and clearances. Barrier heights and clearances shall be in accordance 
with all of the following: 

 
1. The top of the barrier shall be not less than 48 inches (1219 mm) above grade where 

measured on the side of the barrier that faces away from the pool or spa. Such height 
shall exist around the entire perimeter of the barrier and for a distance of 3 feet (914 
mm) measured horizontally from the outside of the required barrier. 

 
2. The vertical clearance between grade and the bottom of the barrier shall not exceed 2 

inches (51 mm) for grade surfaces that are not solid, such as grass or gravel, where 
measured on the side of the barrier that faces away from the pool or spa. 

 
3. The vertical clearance between a surface below the barrier to a solid surface, such as 

concrete, and the bottom of the required barrier shall not exceed 4 inches (102 mm) 
where measured on the side of the required barrier that faces away from the pool or 
spa. 

 
 

4. Where the top of the pool or spa structure is above grade, the barrier shall be installed 
on grade or shall be mounted on top of the pool or spa structure. Where the barrier is 
mounted on the top of the pool or spa, the vertical clearance between the top of the pool 
or spa and the bottom of the barrier shall not exceed 4 inches (102 mm). 

 
305.2.2 Openings. Openings in the barrier shall not allow passage of a 4-inch-diameter (102 
mm) sphere. 

 
305.2.3 Solid barrier surfaces. Solid barriers that do not have openings shall not contain 
indentations or protrusions that form handholds and footholds, except for normal construction 
tolerances and tooled masonry joints. 

 
305.2.4 Mesh fence as a barrier. Mesh fences, other than chain link fences in accordance 
with Section 305.2.7, shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions and 
shall comply with the following: 

 
1. The bottom of the mesh fence shall be not more than 1 inch (25 mm) above the deck or 

installed surface or grade. 
 

2. The maximum vertical clearance from the bottom of the mesh fence and the solid 
surface shall not permit the fence to be lifted more than 4 inches (102 mm) from grade 
or decking. 

 
 
 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 9 
 

3. The fence shall be designed and constructed so that it does not allow passage of a 4- 
inch (102 mm) sphere under any mesh panel. The maximum vertical clearance from 
the bottom of the mesh fence and solid surface shall not be greater than 4 inches (102 
mm) from grade or decking. 

 
4. An attachment device shall attach each barrier section at a height not lower than 45 

inches (1143 mm) above grade. Common attachment devices shall include, but are not 
limited to, devices that provide the security equal to or greater than that of a hook-and- 
eye type latch incorporating a spring-actuated retaining lever such as a safety gate hook. 

 
5. Where a hinged gate is used with a mesh fence, the gate shall comply with Section 

305.3. 
 

6. Patio deck sleeves such as vertical post receptacles that are placed inside the patio 
surface shall be of a nonconductive material. 

 
7. Mesh fences shall not be installed on top of onground residential pools. 

 
305.2.4.1 Setback for mesh fences.  The inside of a mesh fence shall not be closer than 20 
inches (508 mm) to the nearest edge of the water of a pool or spa. 

 
305.2.5 Closely spaced horizontal members. Where the barrier is composed of horizontal 
and vertical members and the distance between the tops of the horizontal members is less than 
45 inches (1143 mm), the horizontal members shall be located on the pool or spa side of the 
fence. Spacing between vertical members shall not exceed 1¾ inches (44 mm) in width. 
Where there are decorative cutouts within vertical members, spacing within the cutouts shall not exceed 
1¾ inches (44 mm) in width. 

 
305.2.6 Widely spaced horizontal members. Where the barrier is composed of horizontal 
and vertical members and the distance between the tops of the horizontal members is 45 inches 
(1143 mm) or more, spacing between vertical members shall not exceed 4 inches (102 mm). 
Where there are decorative cutouts within vertical members, the interior width of the cutouts 
shall not exceed 1¾ inches (44 mm). 

 
305.2.7 Chain link dimensions. The maximum opening formed by a chain link fence shall 
be not more than 1¾ inches (44 mm). Where the fence is provided with slats fastened at the 
top and bottom that reduce the openings, such openings shall be not greater than 1¾ inches (44 
mm). 

 
305.2.7.1 Chain link fencing prohibited. Chain link fencing is not permitted as a barrier 
in public pools built after January 1, 1994. 

 

305.2.8 Diagonal members. Where the barrier is composed of diagonal members, the 
maximum opening formed by the diagonal members shall not be greater than 1¾ inches (44 
mm). The angle of diagonal members shall be not greater than 45 degrees (0.79 rad) from 
vertical. 

 
 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 10 
 

305.2.9 Clear zone. Where equipment, including pool equipment such as pumps, filters and 
heaters, is on the same lot as a pool or spa and such equipment is located outside of the barrier 
protecting the pool or spa, such equipment shall be located not less than 36 inches (914 mm) 
from the outside of the barrier.” 

 
9. Subsection 305.4, “Structure Wall As A Barrier,” of Section 305, “Barrier 

Requirements,” of Chapter 3, “General Compliance,” of the 2021 International Swimming Pool 

and Spa Code is amended to read as follows: 

“305.4 Structure wall as a barrier in one- and two-family dwellings, townhomes, and similar 
developments. Where a wall of a dwelling or structure serves as part of the barrier and where 
doors, gates or windows provide direct access to the pool or spa through that wall, one of the 
following shall be required: 

 
1. Operable windows having a sill height of less than 48 inches (1219 mm) above the 

indoor finished floor, doors and gates shall have an alarm that produces an audible 
warning when the window, door or their screens are opened. The alarm shall be listed 
and labeled as a water hazard entrance alarm in accordance with UL 2017.  
 

2. In dwellings or structures not required to be Accessible units, Type A units or Type B 
units, the operable parts of the alarm deactivation switches shall be located 54 inches 
(1372 mm) or more above the finished floor.  

 
3. In dwellings or structures required to be Accessible units, Type A units or Type B units, the 

operable parts of the alarm deactivation switches shall be located not greater than 54 inches 
(1372 mm) and not less than 48 inches (1219 mm) above the finished floor. 

 
4. In structures other than dwellings, the operable parts of the alarm deactivation switches 

shall be located not greater than 54 inches (1372 mm) and not less than 48 inches (1220 
mm) above the finished floor. 

 
5. A safety cover that is listed and labeled in accordance with ASTM F1346 is installed 

for the pools and spas. 
 

6. An approved means of protection, such as self-closing doors with self-latching devices, 
is provided. Such means of protection shall provide a degree of protection that is not 
less than the protection afforded by Item 1 or 2. 

 
305.4.1 Structure wall as a barrier in apartments, property owner associations and 
similar residential developments. The wall of a building with openings for emergency escape 
and rescue shall be as provided in Section 305.9.2 of this code. Other windows that are part of 
a pool yard enclosure shall be permanently closed and unable to be opened for public pools.” 

 
 
 
 
 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 11 
 

10. Subsection 305.6, “Natural Barriers,” of Section 305, “Barrier Requirements,” of 

Chapter 3, “General Compliance,” of the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is 

amended to read as follows: 

“305.6 Natural barriers used in one- and two-family dwellings, townhomes, and similar 
developments. In the case where the pool or spa area abuts the edge of a lake or other natural body 
of water, public access is not permitted or allowed along the shoreline, and required barriers extend 
to and beyond the water’s edge not less than 18 inches (457 mm), a barrier is not required between 
the natural body of water shoreline and the pool or spa.” 

 
11. Section 305, “Barrier Requirements,” of Chapter 3, “General Compliance,” of the 2021 

International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is amended by adding a new Subsection 305.9, 

“Additional Requirements for Swimming Pools and Spas,” to read as follows: 

“305.9 Additional requirements for swimming pools and spas. Swimming pools and spas shall 
comply with the requirements of Sections 305.9 through 305.10.4 and other applicable sections of 
this code. This section does not preempt state law. Compliance with this section is not a safe harbor 
for compliance with state law. Refer to Chapter 43A, Swimming Pools, of the Dallas City Code for 
additional provisions on pools as enforced by the Dallas Health Department. 

 

305.9.1 Fence required. Every owner, purchaser under contract, lessee, tenant, licensee or 
other person in possession of a tract, lot or premises on which a swimming pool or spa is 
situated shall at all times maintain a fence, wall or barrier that completely surrounds the 
swimming pool or spa. 
 
305.9.2 Swimming pool and spa filling. A swimming pool or spa must be provided with a 
barrier that must be installed, inspected and approved prior to plastering or filling the 
swimming pool or spa with water.” 

 
12. Section 305, “Barrier Requirements,” of Chapter 3, “General Compliance,” of the 

2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code,” is amended by adding a new Subsection 305.10, 

“Enclosures for Public Swimming Pools and Spas,” to read as follows: 

“305.10 Enclosures for public swimming pools and spas. Public swimming pools and spas shall 
be completely enclosed in accordance with Sections 305.10.1 through 305.10.4. 

 
305.10.1 Enclosures for Class A and B pools and spas. Class A and B pools and spas 
shall be enclosed by a barrier consisting of the following, or its equivalent: a fence, portion 
of a building, wall or other durable enclosure. 

 
 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 12 
 

1. A building that serves as part of the enclosure shall have doors or gates that open into 
the pool yard only if: 

 
1.1. any doors or gates between the building and the pool yard are for entry into a 

storage room, restroom, shower room, dressing room or mechanical room 
adjacent to the pool; 

 
1.2. the room does not have any door or gate openings to the outside of the pool 

yard enclosure; and 
 

1.3. the room does not contain any gas chlorine containers. 
 

2. The enclosure, including doors and gates, shall: 
 

2.1. have a minimum effective perpendicular height of at least 6 feet as measured 
from the ground surface on the outside of the fence; 

 
2.2. have no opening in the enclosure through or under which a 4-inch diameter 

sphere can pass; 
 

2.3. be designed and constructed so that it cannot be readily climbed; and 
 

2.4. have all doors, gates and windows in the enclosure directly and continuously 
supervised by staff at the pool during hours of operation, or locked to prevent 
unauthorized entry. 

 
305.10.2 Enclosures for Class C pools and spas and Class D pools at a Class C facility 
(such as apartment, property owner associations and similar residential developments). 
Pool yards and spa yards of apartments, property owner associations and similar residential 
developments must have an enclosure that meets the following requirements in addition to the 
requirements of Sections 305.2 through 305.8: 

 
1. The height of the pool yard enclosure must be at least 48 inches measured from the 

ground on the side away from the pool. 
 

2. Openings under the pool yard enclosure may not allow a sphere of 4 inches in diameter 
to pass under the pool yard enclosure. 

 
3. If the pool yard enclosure is constructed with horizontal and vertical members and the 

distance between the tops of the horizontal members is at least 45 inches, the openings 
may not allow a sphere 4 inches in diameter to pass through the enclosure. 

 
4. If the pool yard enclosure is constructed with horizontal and vertical members and the 

distance between the tops of the horizontal members is less than 45 inches, the openings 
may not allow a sphere 1¾ inches in diameter to pass through the enclosure. 

 
 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 13 
 

5. The use of chain link fencing materials is prohibited entirely for a new pool yard 
enclosure that is constructed after January 1, 1994. The use of diagonal fencing 
members that are lower than 49 inches above the ground is prohibited for a new pool 
yard enclosure that is constructed after January 1, 1994. 

 
6. Decorative designs or cutouts on or in the pool yard enclosure may not contain any 

openings greater than 1¾ inches in any direction. 
 

7. Indentations or protrusions in a solid pool yard enclosure without any openings may 
not be greater than normal construction tolerances and tooled masonry joints on the 
side away from the pool. 

 
8. Permanent equipment or structures may not be constructed or placed in a manner that 

makes them readily available for climbing over the pool yard enclosure. 
 

9. The wall of a building may be part of the pool yard enclosure only if the doors and 
windows of the wall comply with Section 305.10.2.3 and 305.10.2.4. 

 
305.10.2.1 Gates for Class C pools and spas and Class D pools at a Class C facility. 
Gates of the enclosures into pool yards and spa yards of apartments, property owner 
associations and similar residential developments must meet the following requirements: 

 
1. Except as provided in Section 305.10.2.2, a gate in a fence or wall enclosing 

a pool yard as required by Section 305.10.2 must: 
 

1.1. have a self-closing and self-latching device; 
 

1.2. have hardware enabling it to be locked at the option of whoever 
controls the gate by a padlock or a built-in lock operated by key, 
card or combination; and 

 
1.3. open outward away from the pool yard. 

 
2. Except as provided in Item 3 and Section 305.10.2.2, a gate latch must be 

installed so that it is at least 60 inches above the ground, except that it may 
be installed lower if: 

 
2.1. the latch is installed on the pool yard side of the gate only and is at 

least 3 inches below the top of the gate; and 
 

2.2. the gate or enclosure has no opening greater than ½ inch in any 
direction within 18 inches from the latch, including the space 
between the gate and the gate post to which the gate latches. 

 
3. A gate latch may be located 42 inches or higher above the ground if the gate 

cannot be opened by key, card or combination on both sides of the gate. 
 
 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 14 
 

305.10.2.2 Existing pool yard enclosures. Existing enclosures into pool yards and spa 
yards of apartments, property owner associations and similar residential developments 
must meet the following requirements: 

 
1. If a pool yard enclosure is constructed or modified before January 1, 1994, 

and no municipal ordinance containing standards for pool yard enclosures 
were applicable at the time of construction or modification, the enclosure 
must comply with the requirements of Sections 305.9.2 and 305.9.2.1, except 
that: 

 
1.1. if the enclosure is constructed with chain link metal fencing 

material, the openings in the enclosure may not allow a sphere 2¼ 
inches in diameter to pass through the enclosure; or 

 
1.2. if the enclosure is constructed with horizontal and vertical members 

and the distance between the tops of the horizontal members is at 
least 36 inches, the openings in the enclosure may not allow a sphere 
4 inches in diameter to pass through the enclosure. 

 
2. If a pool yard enclosure is constructed or modified before January 1, 1994, 

and if the enclosure is in compliance with applicable municipal ordinances 
existing on January 1, 1994, and containing standards for pool yard 
enclosures, Sections 305.10.2, 305.10.2.1(1) and 305.10.2.1(2) do not apply 
to    the enclosure. 
 

305.10.2.3 Doors for Class C pools and spas and Class D pools at a Class C facility. 
Doors of the enclosure into pool yards and spa yards of apartments, property owner 
associations and similar residential developments must meet the following requirements: 

 
1. A door, sliding glass door or French door may not open directly into a pool 

yard if the date of electrical service for initial construction of the building 
or pool is on or after January 1, 1994. 

 
2. A door, sliding glass door or French door may open directly into a pool 

yard if the date of electrical service for initial construction of the building 
or pool is before January 1, 1994 and the pool yard enclosure complies with 
Items 3, 4 or 5, as applicable. 

 
3. If a door of a building, other than a sliding glass door or screen door opens 

into a pool yard, the door must have a: 
 

3.1. latch that automatically engages when the door is closed; 
 

3.2. spring-loaded door-hinge pin, automatic door closer or similar 
device to cause the door to close automatically; and 

 
 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 15 
 

3.3. keyless bolting device that is installed not less than 36 inches or 
more than 48 inches above the interior floor. 

 
4. If French doors of a building open to the pool yard, one of the French doors 

must comply with Item 3.1 above and the other door must have: 
 

4.1. a keyed dead bolt or keyless bolting device capable of insertion into 
the doorjamb above the door, and a keyless bolting device capable 
of insertion into the floor or threshold; or 

 
4.2. a bolt with at least a ¾-inch throw installed inside the door and 

operated from the edge of the door that is capable of insertion into 
the doorjamb above the door and another bolt with at least a ¾-inch 
throw installed inside the door and operated from the edge of the 
door that is capable of insertion into the floor or threshold. 

 
5. If a sliding glass door of a building opens into the pool yard, the sliding 

glass door must have: 
 

5.1. a sliding door handle latch or sliding door security bar that is 
installed no more than 48 inches above the interior floor; and 

 
5.2. a sliding door pin lock that is installed not more than 48 inches above 

the interior floor. 
 

6. A door, sliding glass door or French door that opens into a pool yard from 
an area of a building that is not used by residents and that has no access to 
an area outside the pool yard is not required to have a lock, latch, dead bolt 
or keyless bolting device. 

 
7. A keyed dead bolt, keyless bolting device, sliding door pin lock or sliding 

door security bar installed before September 1, 1993 may be installed not 
more than 54 inches from the floor. 

 
8. A keyed dead bolt or keyless dead bolt, as described by Section 202, 

installed in a dwelling on or after September 1, 1993, must have a bolt with 
a throw of not less than 1 inch. 

 
305.10.2.4 Windows and window screens for Class C pools and spas and Class D 
pools at a Class C facility. Windows and window screens into pool yards and spa yards 
of apartments, property owner associations and similar residential developments must 
meet the following requirements: 

 
1. A wall of a building constructed before January 1, 1994 may not be used as part of a 

pool yard enclosure unless each window in the wall has a latch and unless each 
window screen on a window in the wall is affixed by a window screen latch, screws 
or similar means. This does not require the installation of window screens. 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 16 
 

 
2. A wall of a building constructed on or after January 1, 1994 may not be used as part 

of a pool yard enclosure unless each ground floor window in the wall is permanently 
closed and unable to be opened. 

 
305.10.2.5 Building located in pool yard for Class C pools and spas and Class D pools 
at a Class C facility. Each door, sliding glass door, window and window screen of each 
dwelling unit in a residential building located in the enclosed pool yard must comply with 
Sections 305.10.2.3 and 305.10.2.4. 

 
305.10.3 Enclosures for all other Class C pools and spas and Class D pools at Class C 
facilities (such as hotels, motels, RV parks, etc.). A Class C pool or spa or a Class D pool at a 
Class C facility that is not subject to Section 305.9.2 must have a pool yard or spa yard enclosure 
in compliance with this section. 

 
1. The pool yard or spa yard enclosure for a pool or spa subject to this section must 

consist of one or a combination of a fence, portion of a building, wall or other 
durable enclosure. The enclosure must comply with the following: 

 
1.1. The enclosure must have a minimum perpendicular height of at least 48 

inches as measured from the ground surface on the outside of the fence. 
 

1.2. Openings in or under the enclosure must not allow the passage of a 4-inch 
diameter sphere. 

 
1.3. Planters or other structures that might allow small children to climb over 

the enclosure are not permitted within 36 inches, measured horizontally, 
from the outside of the enclosure. 

 
1.4. Chain link fencing may be used for the enclosure of a pool or spa installed 

on or before October 1, 1999 if the chain link fencing was installed on or 
before September 1, 2004. Chain link fencing cannot be used for an 
enclosure of a pool or spa installed after September 1, 2004. 

 
1.5. Doors, gates or windows that open into a building are allowed as part of the 

enclosure of a pool or spa installed on or before October 1, 1999. Windows 
that are capable of being opened are not allowed as part of an enclosure for 
a pool or spa erected after October 1, 1999. Doors or gates      of a building 
that are capable of being opened are not allowed as part of   an enclosure 
for a pool or spa installed after October 1, 1999 unless: 

 
1.5.1. the doors or gates between the building and the pool yard or spa 

yard are for entry into a storage room, restroom, shower room, 
dressing room or mechanical room adjacent to the pool; 

 
1.5.2. the room does not have any door or gate openings to the outside 

of the pool yard or spa yard enclosure; and 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 17 
 

 
1.5.3. the room does not contain any gas chlorine containers. 

 
2. Gates and doors for pool yard or spa yard enclosures for pools and spas subject  to 

this section must: 
 

2.1. be equipped with self-closing and self-latching devices and be latched when 
the pool or spa is not in use; the self-closing device must be designed to 
keep the gate or door securely closed and the self-latching device must latch 
when the gate is allowed to close within its range of operation, which is 
from its fully open position to 6 inches from the fully closed position; 

 
2.2. open outward away from the pool or spa except for gates constructed before 

October 1, 1999 in compliance with applicable city ordinances; 
 

2.3. have hand activated door or gate opening hardware located at least 3½ feet 
above the deck or hallway; 

 
2.4. be capable of being locked; 

 
2.5. be locked if it is for entry into a Class A or B pool or a spa and the pool or 

spa is not open for use; and 
 

2.6. be locked if it is for entry into a Class C pool or a spa or a Class D pool at 
a Class C facility and the pool or spa needs to be closed because of repairs, 
hazards or other conditions. 

 
3. Pool yard and spa yard enclosures for pools and spas installed after October 1, 

1999 must be constructed so that all persons are required to pass through an 
enclosure gate or door in order to gain access to the pool or spa. All gates and doors 
exiting a pool yard or spa yard of a pool installed after October 1, 1999 or a spa 
must open into a public area or walkway accessible to all users of the pool or spa. 

 
305.10.4 Propping open gates prohibited. The owner of a pool or spa, or the employee or 
agent of the owner of a pool or spa shall not knowingly allow a gate in a pool yard or spa yard 
enclosure to be propped open or remain propped open. A person shall not prop open a gate to a 
pool yard or spa yard unless an agent, employee or contractor of the owner is present and doing 
construction, maintenance or repair work in the pool yard or spa yard or on its enclosure that 
reasonably requires the gate to be propped open.” 

 
13. Paragraph 307.1.4, “Accessibility,” of Subsection 307.1, “General Design 

Requirements,” of Section 307, “General Design,” of Chapter 3, “General Compliance,” of the 

2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is amended to read as follows: 

 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 18 
 

“307.1.4 Accessibility. An accessible route to public pools and spas shall be provided in 
accordance with the Dallas [International] Building Code. Accessibility within public pools 
and spas shall be provided as required by the accessible recreational facilities provisions of the 
Dallas [International] Building Code. Pool and spa lifts providing an accessible means of entry 
into the water shall be listed and labeled in accordance with UL 60335-2-1000 and be installed 
in accordance with ICC A117.1 and NFPA 70. 

 

Exception: Components of projects regulated by and registered with the Architectural 
Barriers Division of the Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation shall be deemed 
to be in compliance with the requirements of this chapter.” 

 

14. Subsection 310.1, “General,” of Section 310, “Suction Entrapment Avoidance,” of 

Chapter 3, “General Compliance,” of the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is 

amended to read as follows: 

“310.1 General. Suction entrapment avoidance for residential pools and spas shall be provided in 
accordance with APSP 7 or for public swimming pools in accordance with Section 265.190 of the 
Texas Administrative Code. 

 
Exceptions: 

 
1. Portable spas and portable exercise spas listed and labeled in accordance with UL 1563 or 

CSA C22.2 No. 218.1. 
 

2. Suction entrapment avoidance for wading pools shall be provided in accordance with 
Section 405.” 

 
15. Subsection 402.12, “Water Envelopes,” of Section 402, “Diving,” of Chapter 4, 

“Public Swimming Pools,” of the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is amended to 

read as follows: 

“402.12 Water envelopes. The minimum diving water envelopes shall be in accordance with 
Section 256.186(c) and Figure 265.186(e)(6) of the Texas Administrative Code [Table 402.12]. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 19 
 

Figure: 25 TAC §265.186 (e) (6) 
Maximum Diving Board Height Over 
Water 

¾ Meter 1 Meter 3 Meters 

Max. Diving Board Length 12 ft. 16 ft. 16 ft. 
Minimum Diving Board Overhang 2 ft. 6 in. 5 ft. 5 ft. 
D1 Minimum 8 ft. 6 in. 11 ft. 2 in. 12 ft. 2 in. 
D2 Minimum 9 ft. 10 ft. 10 in. 11 ft. 10 in. 
D3 Minimum 4 ft. 6 ft. 6 ft. 
L1 Minimum 4 ft. 5 ft. 5 ft. 
L2 Minimum 12 ft. 16 ft. 5 in. 19 ft. 9 in. 
L3 Minimum 14 ft. 10 in. 13 ft. 2 in. 13 ft. 11 in. 
L4 Minimum 30 ft. 10 in. 34 ft. 7 in. 38 ft. 8 in. 
L5 Minimum 8 ft. 10 ft. 13 ft. 
H Minimum 16 ft. 16 ft. 16 ft. 
From Plummet to Pool Wall at Side 9 ft. 10 ft. 11 ft. 6 in. 
From Plummet to Adjacent Plummet 10 ft. 10 ft. 10 ft. 

 
H (Overhead 

Obstruction or Ceiling) 

 
 

 
Pt A Pt. B Pt. C 

2’6” Min. 

 

4’Min 

11° Max 

 
4’6” Min D2 

D1 R 6’6”Typical 

 
D 

1 

30º Max. 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 20 
 

10 Max Slope 

Typical 

 

 

 

 
 

4’Min 

 
 

” 
 

16. Table 402.12, “Minimum Diving Water Envelopes,” of Section 402, “Diving,” of 

Chapter 4, “Public Swimming Pools,” of the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is 

deleted. 

17. Figure 402.12, “(Minimum Diving Water Envelopes) Construction Dimensions 

for Water Envelopes for Class B and Class C Pools,” of Section 402, “Diving,” of Chapter 4, 

“Public Swimming Pools,” of the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is deleted. 

18. Subsection 402.13, “Ladders for Diving Equipment,” of Section 402, “Diving,” of 

Chapter 4, “Public Swimming Pools,” of the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is 

amended to read as follows: 

“402.13 Ladders for diving equipment. Ladders shall be provided with two grab rails or two 
handrails. There shall be a uniform distance between ladder treads, with a 7-inch (178 mm) 
minimum distance and 12 inch (305 mm) maximum distance. Supports, platforms, steps and 
ladders for diving equipment shall be designed to carry the anticipated loads. Steps and ladders 
shall be of corrosion-resistant material, easily cleanable and with slip-resistant tread. 

 

[Exception: The distance between treads for the top and bottom riser can vary but shall be not 
less than 7 inches (178 mm) and not greater than 12 inches (305 mm).]” 

 

19. Paragraph 411.2.1, “Tread Dimensions and Area,” of Subsection 411.2, “Pool 

Stairs,” of Section 411, “Special Features,” of Chapter 4, “Public Swimming Pools,” of the 2021 

International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is amended to read as follows: 

L1 L2 L3 

  L4   

4’Min 

10’ 
(1 Meter)” 

 
 

L5 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 21 
 

“411.2.1 Tread dimensions and area. Treads shall have a minimum unobstructed horizontal 
depth (i.e., horizontal run) of 12 inches and a minimum width of 20 inches [not be less than 24 
inches (607mm) at the leading edge. Treads shall have an unobstructed surface area of not less 
than 240 square inches (0.154 m2) and an unobstructed horizontal depth of not less than 10 
inches (254 mm) at the centerline].” 

 

20. Paragraph 411.2.2, “Risers,” of Subsection 411.2, “Pool Stairs,” of Section 411, 

“Special Features,” of Chapter 4, “Public Swimming Pools,” of the 2021 International Swimming 

Pool and Spa Code is amended to read as follows: 

“411.2.2 Risers. Risers for steps shall have a maximum uniform height of 10 inches, with the 
bottom riser height allowed to taper to zero [,except for the bottom riser, shall have a uniform 
height of not greater than 12 inches (305 mm) measured at the centerline. The bottom riser 
height is allowed to vary to the floor].” 

 

21. Subsection 411.5, “Underwater Seats, Benches, and Swimouts,” of Section 411, 

“Special Features,” of Chapter 4, “Public Swimming Pools,” of the 2021 International Swimming 

Pool and Spa Code is amended to read as follows: 

“411.5 Underwater seats, benches, and swimouts. The design and construction of underwater 
seats, benches, and swimouts shall comply with Sections 411.5.1 and 411.5.2. 

 
411.5.1 Swimouts. Swimouts, located in either the deep or shallow area of a pool, shall 
comply with all of the following: 

 
1. The horizontal surface shall be not greater than 20 inches (508 mm) below 

the waterline. 
 

2. An unobstructed surface shall be provided that is equal to or greater than 
that required for the top tread of the pool stairs in accordance with Section 
411.2. 

 
3. Where used as an entry and exit access, swimouts shall be provided with 

steps that comply with the pool stair requirements of Section 411.2. 
 

4. The leading edge shall be visibly set apart and provided with a horizontal 
solid or broken stripe at least one inch wide on the top surface along the 
front leading edge of each step. This strip shall be plainly visible to persons 
on the pool deck. The strip shall be a contrasting color to the background 
on which it is applied, and the color shall be permanent in nature and shall 
be a slip-resistant surface. 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 22 
 

 

411.5.2 Underwater seats and benches. Underwater seats and benches, whether used 
alone or in conjunction with pool stairs, shall comply with all of thefollowing: 

 
1. The horizontal surface shall be not greater than 20 inches (508 mm) below 

the waterline. 
 

2. An unobstructed surface shall be provided that is not less than 10 inches 
(254 mm) in depth and not less than 24 inches (607 mm) in width. 

 
3. Underwater seats and benches shall not be used as the required entry and 

exit access. 
 

4. Where underwater seats are located in the deep area of the pool where 
manufactured or constructed diving equipment is installed, such seats shall 
be located outside of the minimum diving water envelope for diving 
equipment. 

 
5. The leading edge shall be visibly set apart and provided with a horizontal 

solid or broken stripe at least one inch wide on the top surface along the 
front leading edge of each step. This stripe shall be plainly visible to persons 
on the pool deck. The stripe shall be a contrasting color to the background 
on which it is applied, and the color shall be permanent in nature and shall 
be a slip-resistant surface. 

 

6. The horizontal surface shall be at or below the waterline. 
 

7. A tanning ledge or sun shelf used as the required entry and exit access shall 
be located not greater than 12 inches (305 mm) below the waterline.” 

 
22. Subsection 603.2, “Class D-2 Pools,” of Section 603, “Markings and Indicators,” 

of Chapter 6, “Aquatic Recreation Facilities,” of the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa 

Code is amended by adding a new Paragraph 603.2.1, “Class A and B Pools,” to read as follows: 

“603.2.1 Class A and B pools. Class A and B pools over five feet deep: the transition point of 
the pool from the shallow area to the deep area of the pool shall be visually set apart with a 
four-inch minimum width row of floor tile, a painted line or similar means using a color 
contrasting with the bottom; and a rope and float line shall be provided between one foot and 
two feet on the shallow side of the five-foot depth along and parallel to this depth from one 
side of the pool to the other side. The floats shall be spaced at not greater than seven-foot 
intervals; and the floats shall be secured so they will not slide or bunch up. The stretched float 
line shall be of sufficient size and strength to offer a good handhold and support loads normally 
imposed by users. If the owner or operator of the pool knows or should have known in the 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 23 
 

exercise of ordinary care that a rope or float is missing, broken or defective, the problem shall 
be promptly remedied.” 

 
23. Paragraph 610.5.1, “Uniform Height of 9 Inches,” of Subsection 610.5, “Pool 

Steps,” of Section 610, “Special Features,” of Chapter 6, “Aquatic Recreation Facilities,” of the 

2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is amended to read as follows: 

“610.5.1 Uniform height of 10 [9] inches. Except for the bottom riser, risers at the centerline 
shall have a maximum uniform height of 10 [9] inches (254 [229]mm). The bottom riser height 
shall be permitted to vary from the other risers.” 

 
24. Subsection 804.1, “General,” of Section 804, “Diving Water Envelopes,” of 

Chapter 8, “Permanent Inground Residential Swimming Pools,” of the 2021 International 

Swimming Pool and Spa Code is amended to read as follows: 

“804.1 General. The minimum diving water envelopes shall be in accordance with Table 804.1 
and Figure 804.1, or the manufacturer’s specifications, whichever is greater. Negative construction 
tolerances shall not be applied to the dimensions of the minimum diving water envelopes given in 
Table 804.1.” 

 
25.  The use note to Chapter 11, “Referenced Standards,” of the 2021 International 

Swimming Pool and Spa Code is amended to read as follows: 

“User note: 
 

About this chapter: This code contains numerous references to standards promulgated by other 
organizations that are used to provide requirements for materials and methods of construction. 
Chapter 11 contains a comprehensive list of all standards that are referenced in this code. These 
standards, in essence, are part of this code to the extent of the reference to the standard.  

 
This chapter lists the standards that are referenced in various sections of this document.  The 
standards are listed herein by the promulgating agency of the standard, the standard identification, 
the effective date and title, and the section or sections of this document that reference the standard.  
The application of the referenced standards shall be as specified in Section 101.4 of Chapter 52, 
“Administrative Procedures for the Construction Codes,” of the Dallas City Code [102.7]. 

 
The referenced standards are applicable only with the associated edition of the International Codes 
referenced herein as amended. 

 
The referenced edition of the 2015 International Codes are applicable until superceded by the 
adoption of the 2021 edition of the International Codes.” 

 
 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 24 
 

 
26. The ICC Standards in Chapter 11, “Referenced Standards,” of the 2021 

International Swimming Pool and Spa Code are amended to read as follows: 

 

“ICC International Code Council, Inc. 
500 New Jersey Avenue, NW 6th Floor 

 Washington, DC 20001 
 

IBC—15: International Building Code® 
IBC—21: International Building Code® 

201.3, 304.2, 306.1, 307.2, 410.1 
 

ICC 901/SRCC 100—2020: Solar Thermal Collector Standard 
316.6.2 

 
ICC 902/APSP/SRCC 400—2020: Solar Pool and Spa Heating System Standard 
   Table 3016.2(2) 
 
ICC A117.1—2017: Accessible and Usable Buildings and Facilities 
   307.1.4 
 
IECC—15: International Energy Conservation Code® 
IECC—21: International Energy Conservation Code® 

201.3, 316.4 
 

IFC—15: International Fire Code® 
IFC—21: International Fire Code® 

201.3 
 

IFGC—15: International Fuel Gas Code® 
IFGC—21: International Fuel Gas Code® 

201.3, 316.4 
 

IMC—15: International Mechanical Code® 
IMC—21: International Mechanical Code® 

201.3, 316.4 
 

IPC—15: International Plumbing Code ® 
IPC—21: International Plumbing Code® 

201.3, 302.2, 302.5, 302.6, 306.8, 318.2, 410.1 
 
 
 
 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 25 
 

IRC—15: International Residential Code® 
IRC—21: International Residential Code® 

102.7.1, 201.3, 302.1, 302.5, 302.6, 304.2, 306.1, 306.3, 306.8, 307.2, 316.4, 318.2, 
321.2.1, 321.4, 703.1, 802.1, 802.2” 

 
 

27. Appendix A of the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is not adopted. 

28. All chapters of the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code adopted by this 

ordinance are subchapters of Chapter 62 of the Dallas City Code, as amended. 

29. All references in the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code to the fire code, 

building code, plumbing code, mechanical code, electrical code, residential code, existing building 

code, energy conservation code, fuel gas code, and green construction code, refer, respectively, to 

Chapters 16, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, and 61 of the Dallas City Code. 

SECTION 2. Any errata corrections of the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa 

Code published by the International Code Council are considered as part of this code. 

SECTION 3. That a person violating a provision of this ordinance, upon conviction, is 

punishable by a fine not to exceed $2,000. No offense committed and no liability, penalty, or 

forfeiture, either civil or criminal, incurred prior to the effective date of this ordinance will be 

discharged or affected by this ordinance. Prosecutions and suits for such offenses, liabilities, 

penalties, and forfeitures may be instituted, and causes of action pending on the effective date of 

this ordinance may proceed, as if the former laws applicable at the time the offense, liability, 

penalty, or forfeiture was committed or incurred had not been amended, repealed, reenacted, or 

superseded, and all former laws will continue in effect for these purposes. 

SECTION 4. That the terms and provisions of this ordinance are severable and are 

governed by Section 1-4 of Chapter 1 of the Dallas City Code, as amended. 

 



Chapter 63 (Dallas Swimming Pool & Spa Code) – Page 26 
 

SECTION 5. That this ordinance will take effect on May 16, 2022, and it is accordingly so 

ordained. 

 
 
 

APPROVED AS TO FORM 
 

CHRISTOPHER J. CASO, City Attorney 
 
 

BY  
Assistant City Attorney 

 
 

Passed    


